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Details

Hersteller: Highfield

Modell: Classic 400

Jahr: 2025

Bedingung: Neu

Motor: , 300 hp

Motortyp:  

Kraftstofftyp: Benzin

Länge: 3.96 m (12.99 ft)

Breite: 1.97 m (6.46 ft)

Kabine: 0

Liegeplätze: 0
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Beschreibung

EN
  Highfield Classic 400 aluminium RIB with Honda BF40 LRTU
outboard and capacity of 8. This RIB offers extra comfort from
the double hulled deck. The high quality finish and luxury look
belies the fact that this range of tenders has been designed to
work hard. A durable aluminium hull coupled with full length
keel guards make these ideal for those beach-hopping days
with friends and family. The large weight savings achieved
compared to equivalent GRP tenders means you’ll enjoy
impressive performance with smaller engines, and with
excellent payload capacities, the Highfield Classic 400 really
does offer a tender for everyone. 4mm thick powder coated
marine grade aluminium. Valmex PVC tubes - 1100 DTEX
coated fabric. Including rigging and fit out with battery. Design
category C. NB - library photos may not reflect specification of
boat.

Cockpit: FCT8 steering system with carbon dash for FCT8
console. Optional Equipment: Electrical pack for console,
electrical pack for boat, roll bar, moulded bow cleat, transom
storage box, Bimini, extra seat, boat cover. Option to have GT
console.

Electronics: The FCT8 console package is a perfect addition the
Classic 400 model giving you an additional level of comfort
and enjoyability for your day on the water. The rear bench seat
with high backrest and closed cell foam cushions which won't
hold water, are perfect for a comfortable day exploring. The
console helm is an open style design giving you
unprecedented legroom in a boat of its size while, LED flush
mounted switch panel, navigation lights and bilge pump are all
included.

Machinery: Honda BF40 outboard. Internal under-deck fuel
tank. Option to Upgrade to Honda BF50 LRTU for extra
£1,475.00

Trailer: Morgan Marine can supply a suitable trailer or
launching trolley - at extra cost. Please call 01206 302003 for
options and prices.

Allgemeine Information

Hersteller: Highfield

Modell: Classic 400

Jahr: 2025

Bedingung: Neu

Motor

Motor: , 300 hp

Motortyp:  

Kraftstofftyp: Benzin

Messungen

Länge: 3.96 m (12.99 ft)

Breite: 1.97 m (6.46 ft)

Tief: 0 m (0.00 ft)

Gewicht: 0  ()

Unterkunft

Kabine: 0

Liegeplätze: 0
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